
Everything You Need To Know About Raising
Healthy Happy Pet Hermit Crabs
Hermit crabs are fascinating creatures that make wonderful pets. They are
relatively low-maintenance and can provide years of enjoyment. However, it
is important to do your research before bringing a hermit crab home. Hermit
crabs have specific needs that must be met in order for them to thrive.
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Housing

The most important aspect of hermit crab care is providing them with a
suitable home. Hermit crabs need a terrarium that is at least 10 gallons in
size. The terrarium should have a secure lid to prevent the crabs from
escaping. The terrarium should also be well-ventilated to prevent the air
from becoming stagnant.
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The substrate in the terrarium should be a mixture of sand and coconut
fiber. The sand should be deep enough for the crabs to bury themselves in.
The coconut fiber will help to keep the humidity in the terrarium.

Hermit crabs also need a variety of hiding places in their terrarium. These
hiding places can be made from rocks, logs, or plastic tubes. The hiding
places will give the crabs a sense of security and will help to reduce stress.

Diet

Hermit crabs are omnivores and will eat a variety of foods. Their diet should
include a mix of fresh fruits, vegetables, and proteins. Some good food
options for hermit crabs include:

* Fruits: apples, bananas, grapes, mangoes, melons, oranges,
strawberries, blueberries * Vegetables: carrots, celery, corn, peas, spinach,
sweet potatoes * Proteins: boiled eggs, cooked chicken, fish, shrimp,
worms

Hermit crabs also need a source of calcium in their diet. Calcium is
essential for the development and maintenance of their shells. A good
source of calcium is cuttlebone, which can be found at most pet stores.

Socialization

Hermit crabs are social creatures and do best when kept in groups of at
least two or three. However, it is important to introduce new crabs to the
group slowly and carefully. Hermit crabs can be territorial and may fight
with each other if they are not properly introduced.



To introduce new crabs to a group, start by placing them in a separate
enclosure for a few days. This will give them time to get used to each
other's scent. Once they seem to be getting along, you can slowly start to
introduce them to the main group.

Health

Hermit crabs are generally hardy creatures, but they can be susceptible to
a variety of health problems. Some of the most common health problems in
hermit crabs include:

* Shell problems: Hermit crabs need to change shells as they grow. If they
cannot find a suitable shell, they may develop shell problems. Shell
problems can include cracks, chips, and holes. * Respiratory problems:
Hermit crabs can develop respiratory problems if the air in their terrarium is
not well-ventilated. Respiratory problems can include wheezing, coughing,
and difficulty breathing. * Digestive problems: Hermit crabs can develop
digestive problems if they eat the wrong foods. Digestive problems can
include diarrhea, constipation, and vomiting.

If you notice any signs of illness in your hermit crab, it is important to take
them to a veterinarian as soon as possible.

Hermit crabs can make wonderful pets for people of all ages. They are
relatively low-maintenance and can provide years of enjoyment. However, it
is important to do your research before bringing a hermit crab home. Hermit
crabs have specific needs that must be met in order for them to thrive. By
providing your hermit crab with a suitable home, diet, and socialization, you
can help them live a long and healthy life.
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